
From: LisaMarie Klinger <hr@americaapproved.com>
Sent: Monday, June 08, 2015 12:20 PM
To: PUC - Executive.Director
Subject: RE: America Approved Commercial LLC Elec Agg Renewal Application
Attachments: NH Cert of Good Standing 2015.pdf

Good morning,
I have also attached our most recent Certificate of Good Standing for the state of NH that we just received in today’s
mail.
Thank you so much again!

From: LisaMarie Klinger
Sent: Friday, May 29, 2015 3:33 PM
To: executive.director@puc.nh.gov
Cc: LisaMarie Klinger
Subject: America Approved Commercial LLC Elec Agg Renewal Application

Good day,
Attached is an electronic copy of our renewal application being submitted to the PUC.
Please let us know if you need anything else.

Thank you and have a great weekend.

All the best,

LisaMarie Klinger
National Human Resources Director
America Approved Commercial, LLC
0: 239-471-4441
F: 866-355-7432
hr~americaapproved.com
http://www.americaapproved.com
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CERTIFICATE

I, William M. Gardner, Secretary of State of the State of New Hampshire, do hereby

certify that America Approved Commercial, LLC, a(n) Florida limited liability company

registered to do business in New Hampshire on March 27, 2013. I further certify that it is

in good standing as far as this office is concerned, having filed the annual report(s) and

paid the fees required by law.

I,~ 4I4~ In TESTIMONY WHEREOF, I hereto
set my hand and cause to be affixed
the Seal of the State of New Hampshire,
this 4~ day of June, A.D. 2015

William M. Gardner

If Secretary of State



State of New Hampshire

Invoice Number: 6126139

New Hampshire Department of State
William M. Gardner

Secretary of State

Invoice Date: 06/03/2015 10:54 AM User ID: 487

Billing Information

America Approved Commercial, LLC
13451 McGregor Boulevard Unit 29
Fort Myers, FL 33919

Include invoice number on all correspondence and send to:

New Hampshire Department of State
Attn: Accounts Receivable

107 N. Main St.
Concord, NH 03301

For questions regarding this invoice, contact Accounts Receivable at:

(603) 271-3242

Product Description
Certification Order Item Amount
Number Date Qty Pages Cost Extended Due

Corp Copies - Certificates Re: America 4975014 06/03/20 15 1 1 5.00 5.00 Paid
Approved Commercial, LLC
Contact: America Approved Commercial,
LLC
Regarding Entity: America Approved
Commercial, LLC
Shipped Via: Mail

Credit Balance as of 06/04/2015 9:58 AM: $0.00
Invoice Total: $5.00

Payment Details:
Check #1286 for $5.00(4975014:$5.00,) Payment Total: $5.00

Contact(s): Amount Due: $0.00
13451 McGregor Boulevard Unit 29
Fort Myers, FL 33919
United States
pbatz@americaapproved.com
(239) 689-4337
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